
 

 

Modern Slavery Act Statement 
This statement from Quantum Commodity Intelligence has been prepared in line with the UK 
Modern Slavery Act 2015, section 54(1). It is intended to show the ways in which the company 
works to prevent the use of human trafficking and modern slavery in our business and among 
our suppliers.  

What we do and how we work  

We are a provider of news and price data for energy and commodity markets. A single, director- 
and employee-owned entity, we take matters relating to slavery seriously and will do everything 
within our power to ensure it plays no part in our work.  

What our policies are  

Our work requires staff and contractors to attest to and work in line with our code of business 
ethics as well as to adhere to the company’s core values. When joining the company, all 
directors and staff have been made aware of the Modern Slavery Act as well as matters 
associated with modern slavery, how to spot it, and how to flag potential risks. Any matter 
relating to modern slavery flagged by staff, customers, or suppliers will be treated in confidence 
and with the highest priority. It will be fully investigated and appropriately dealt with to ensure 
slavery plays no part in our work.  

How we work with suppliers  

We are committed to making sure modern slavery plays no part in any part of our business, 
either directly or tangentially. While we consider our business risk to be low due to the nature of 
our work, thorough and proportionate due diligence into the work of our suppliers is conducted 
prior to entering a business relationship.  

How we have done and what we will do  

Since our inception, Quantum has:  

• Made all staff aware of the Modern Slavery Act 2015 and informed them of the appropriate 
action to take if they suspect a case of slavery or human trafficking.  

• Ensured procurement strategies and contract terms and conditions include references to 
preventing modern slavery and human trafficking.  

To date, Quantum has received no reports from employees, the public, or law enforcement 
bodies to indicate modern slavery practices have been identified.  

In 2024, Quantum will:  

• Continue to work to raise awareness of modern slavery by reviewing and evaluating the 
measures and processes that we have implemented so far to ensure their effectiveness.  



• Work with our suppliers and customers and review our processes with our partners to identify 
additional measures we can take as a business to combat modern slavery and human 
trafficking.  

• Continue to develop staff on the Modern Slavery Act 2015 and reporting mechanisms if a case 
of slavery or human trafficking is suspected.  

• Make information available to businesses to inform them of the Modern Slavery Act 2015 and 
the appropriate action to take if they suspect a case of slavery or human trafficking.  
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